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version (just for one package) This is my
PPA file: Name: Lucid Builder Url: deb

lucid main Distribution: Ubuntu
Architecture: all Comment: Lucid

Builders PPA Package: libvisual-0.5
Component: main Version:

6.5.0-1~lucid1 Name: Lucid Builder
(lambda) Url: deb lucid main Distribution:
Ubuntu Architecture: all Comment: Lucid

Builders PPA (lambda) Package:
libvisual-0.5 Component: main Version:

6.5.0-1~lucid1 I want to download/install
libvisual-0.5 from the custom repository.
How can I configure apt-get to use the

package version from the custom
repository? I tried: apt-get install -t

custom libvisual-0.5 But it didn't work.
The output is: Reading package lists...

Done Building dependency tree Reading
state information... Done E: Unable to
locate package libvisual-0.5 I also tried
to change the but then I have the same

output. A: You can't. PPA's are not
packages. Instead, you can modify the
apt configuration file directly to point to
the PPA. apt-add-repository will do this

(it adds an entry in /etc/
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plan. Despite your best efforts, odds are
high that you have never succeeded in
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from one mistake to the next as well as
having to constantly monitor your
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progress. You may find it hard to believe
that you actually have the power to

change your behavior. Though we have
all heard of personal experiences that

may suggest that being in the right place
at the right time can cause some

miraculous happenings, that is certainly
not the norm in our world. Itâ��s
probable that you have spent a

considerable amount of your life or will in
the future lab
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